
VOLUNTEER OPPORTUNITIES
Delta Sigma Phi is excited to announce our volunteer opportunities for the upcoming year! This document
provides an overview of the many ways you can support our undergraduate members and advisors.

Please complete this form [~2 minutes to complete] to express your interest in a volunteer opportunity.

Program / Role Description Commitment Deadline to Apply

Alumni
Association
Officer

Alumni Associations provide
opportunities for area-based members
of Delta Sigma Phi to engage in
professional, social, and philanthropic
opportunities.

1-2 hours per
week

Ongoing

Alumni Chapter
Officer

Alumni Chapters provide alumni, from
their chapter of initiation and/or
affiliation, a space to engage with each
other post-graduation. Officers are
responsible for creating opportunities
for professional, social, and
philanthropic growth.

1-2 hours per
week

Ongoing

Alumni
Corporation
Board (ACB)
Member

ACBs provide business guidance to the
chapter, which often includes advising
on matters related to housing and
scholarships. ACB membership is not
limited to men or alumni of Delta
Sigma Phi.

1-2 hours per
week

Ongoing

Chapter Advisors Chapter advisors advise undergraduate
officers and communicate with the
entire chapter as needed. Each
advisory board has a Lead Advisor and
advisors with specific focus areas that
include: growth, health & safety,
finance, campus experience, and
membership experience.

1-4 hours per
week

Ongoing

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSdxKHPveGdfkVJWQ6x3Mm5eEys-ut4KcrVjpMdsaSpliA8LQw/viewform?usp=sf_link


LEAD Weekend
Track Facilitator

Our two-day training program helps
our newest elected officers learn how
to improve operations in recruitment,
health and safety, and membership
experience. This year attendees will be
in-person at three different campuses
in November. Small group facilitators
will lead participants in a specific track
through a pre-written curriculum and
activities, offering operational
guidance and leadership support.
Travel, meals, lodging, and supplies are
covered by the Fraternity.

November
2024; on-site
role

9/1/2024

Leadership
Institute Small
Group Facilitator

Leadership Institute offers an
immersive and physically active
experience that teaches values-based
leadership to a selected group of
undergraduate participants. Facilitators
guide small groups of participants
through a pre-written curriculum and
activities. Travel, meals, lodging, and
supplies are covered by the Fraternity.

July 2025;
5-day on-site
facilitation

9/1/2024

Courage &
Culture Program
Facilitator

Courage & Culture Program Facilitators
are trained to deliver
prevention-related workshops to
collegiate chapters relating to topics
such as alcohol, hazing, and bystander
intervention. Facilitators are expected
to complete a minimum of two
programs per semester. Travel and
additional expenses are covered by the
Fraternity.

One-to-two
workshops
per semester

Ongoing

Foundation
Scholarship
Application
Reviewer

Volunteers review scholarship
applications submitted by
undergraduate and alumni members.
The review period is mid-March to
mid-April.

3-5 total
hours of
application
review

2/15/2025


